Bid Results - Vehicles & Ambulances Cost Only
(see separate chart for costs including equipment)
Recommended awards are in "bold" - Page 1 of 4

2016 Vehicles
Formal Bids opened 12/1/15

12/22/2015

Unit Price Recommended
Spec #1 Bid Amount Make/Model Qty Extended Award
3/4 Ton 4x2 Extended Cab & Chassis - Animal Control 1
Ben Mynatt Chevrolet No bid
Wade Ford S 25,321.00 Ford F250 S 25,321.00
Piedmont Truck Center S 25,141.00 Ford F250 S 25,141.00
Abernethy Chevy Jeep Dodge No bid
Tindol Ford - Alternate price expires 12/31/15; insufficient time S 24,261.77 Ford F250 S 24,261.77
Tindol Ford S 24,661.77 Ford F250 S 24,661.77 $ 24,661.77
Spec #2
Full Size 1/2 Ton 4x4 Pick Up Truck w/ Bed Cover - Building Insp 2
Ben Mynatt Chevrolet S 25,412.84 Chevy Silverado 1500 S 50,825.68 S 50,825.68
Wade Ford S 26,175.00 Ford F150 S 52,350.00
Piedmont Truck Center No bid
Abernethy Chevy Jeep Dodge S 28,506.60 Dodge Ram 1500 S 57,013.20
Tindol Ford - Alternate price expires 12/18/15; insufficient time S 23,540.87 Ford F150 S 47,081.74
Tindol Ford S 25,870.87 Ford F150 S 51,741.74
Spec #3
Hybrid Sedan - Compact - Environmental Health 1
Ben Mynatt Chevrolet No bid
Wade Ford S 22,631.00 Ford C-Max Hybrid S 22,631.00
Piedmont Truck Center No bid
Abernethy Chevy Jeep Dodge No bid
Tindol Ford S 22,435.74 Ford C-Max Hybrid S 22,435.74 S 22,435.74
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Unit Price Recommended
Spec #4 Bid Amount Make/Model Qty Extended Award
Full Size 1/2 Ton 4x4 Pick Up Truck w/ Bed Cover - Env Health 2
Ben Mynatt Chevrolet 25,412.84 Chevy Silverado 1500 S 50,825.68 S 50,825.68
Wade Ford 26,175.00 Ford F150 S 52,350.00
Piedmont Truck Center No bid
Abernethy Chevy Jeep Dodge 28,506.60 Dodge Ram 1500 S 57,013.20
Tindol Ford - Alternate price expires 12/18/15; insufficient time 23,540.87 Ford F150 S 47,081.74
Tindol Ford 25,870.87 Ford F150 S 51,741.74
Spec #5
Mid-Size Hybrid Sedan - Social Services 2
Ben Mynatt Chevrolet No bid
Wade Ford 23,524.00 Ford Fusion Hybrid S 47,048.00
Piedmont Truck Center No bid
Abernethy Chevy Jeep Dodge No bid
Tindol Ford 23,328.74 Ford Fusion Hybrid S 46,657.48 $ 46,657.48
Spec #6
Full Size SUV (AWD or 4WD as long as pursuit rated) Police Pkg -
County Police 1
Ben Mynatt Chevrolet No bid
Wade Ford 28,539.00 Ford Utility Interceptor S 28,539.00 $ 28,539.00
Piedmont Truck Center No bid
Abernethy Chevy Jeep Dodge No bid
Tindol Ford 28,675.30 Ford Explorer PI S 28,675.30
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Unit Price Recommended
Spec #7 Bid Amount Qty Extended Award
Marked Full Size RWD 2WD SUV Police Pkg - County Police & Animal
Control 2
Ben Mynatt Chevrolet No bid
Wade Ford - Doesn't meet Spec; bid with exception 31,326.00 Ford Utility Interceptor S 62,652.00
Piedmont Truck Center No bid
Abernethy Chevy Jeep Dodge No bid
Tindol Ford No bid
Sir Walter per NC Sheriff's Association Contract 35,013.00 Chevy Tahoe police package $ 70,026.00 $ 70,026.00
Spec #8
Marked Full Size Sedan RWD Police Pkg - County Police 12
Ben Mynatt Chevrolet No bid
Wade Ford - Doesn't meet Spec; bid with exception 27,825.00 Ford Interceptor S 333,900.00
Piedmont Truck Center No bid
Abernethy Chevy Jeep Dodge No bid
Tindol Ford No bid
llderton per NC Sheriff's Association Contract 25,231.00 Dodge Charger S 302,772.00 $ 302,772.00
Spec #9 - OPTION 1
Marked Full Size Sedan RWD Police Pkg - Sheriff's Office 3
Ben Mynatt Chevrolet No bid
Wade Ford - Doesn't meet Spec; bid with exception 27,825.00 Ford Interceptor S 83,475.00
Piedmont Truck Center No bid
Abernethy Chevy Jeep Dodge No bid
Tindol Ford No bid
Ilderton per NC Sheriff's Association Contract 25,231.00 Dodge Charger S 75,693.00

Spec 9 Option 2 SUV is requested instead of this Option 1 Sedan
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Unit Price Recommended
Spec #9 - OPTION 2 Bid Amount Qty Extended Award
Marked Full Size AWD SUV (AWD or 4WD as long as pursuit rated)
Police Pkg - Sheriff's Office 3
Ben Mynatt Chevrolet No bid
Wade Ford S 29,477.00 Ford Utility Interceptor S 88,431.00
Piedmont Truck Center No bid
Abernethy Chevy Jeep Dodge No bid
Tindol Ford S 29,345.30 Ford Utility Interceptor S 88,035.90 88,035.90
TOTAL - Vehicle Costs Recommended for Award 684,779.25
AMBULANCES
Ambulance - Type 1, Class 1, 4x2, Config A - GEMS 6
Northwestern - extending FY 14-15 contract as allowed by contract
using FY 15-16 bid price S 267,732.00 Type 1 S 1,606,392.00 1,606,392.00
Ambulances - Sprinter Type ll, Class 1 4x2 Config A - SQUADS 1
Northwestern - extending FY 14-15 contract as allowed by contract
using FY 15-16 bid price S 132,707.00 Sprinter S 132,707.00 132,707.00

TOTAL of Vehicles and Ambulances for Award

See separate chart showing recommended vehicle costs, equipment,

decals and tag/tax/title for total cost related to vehicles.

2,423,878.25



