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2017 Vehicles 1/3/2017

Unit Price Recommended
Spec #1 Bid Amount Make/Model Qty Extended Award
Full Size RWD SUV Police Package 2WD - Animal Control 1
Ben Mynatt $ 33,774.00 Chevy Tahoe $ 33,774.00 $ 33,774.00
liderton No bid
Tindol Ford No bid
Piedmont Truck Center No bid
Abernethy Chrysler Jeep No bid

Spec #2
Full Size Sedan RWD or AWD Police Package - County-Rolice

Ben Mynatt - RWD

llderton - RWD

Tindol Ford - AWD, engine is 3.7L; doesn't meet the 5.7L min spec
Piedmont Truck Center

Abernethy Chrysler Jeep

Since Spec #2 low bid is non-responsive due to engine spec, staff
recommends rejecting Spec #2 bids and awarding Police sedans per Spec #3

S 27,183.00 Chevy Caprice S -
$ 25,407.00 Dodge Charger S -
S 24,995.89 Ford Interceptor S -
No bid
No bid

Recommend purchasing both (3) Sheriff and (14) Police per Spec #3 = 17 qty

Spec #3 Sheriff's units will be white and County Police units will be silver

Full Size Sedan RWD or AWD Police Package - Sheriff's Office & County Police 17

Ben Mynatt - RWD S 27,183.00 Chevy Caprice S 462,111.00

liderton - RWD $ 24,427.00 Dodge Charger $ 415,259.00 $ 415,259.00
Tindol Ford - AWD, engine is 3.7L; doesn't meet the 5.7L min spec S 24,995.89 Ford Interceptor S 424,930.13

Piedmont Truck Center No bid

Abernethy Chrysler Jeep No bid

Spec #4

Full Size 4-Doors Utility Vehicle Extended Wheelbase 4x4-GEMS 1

Ben Mynatt (with exception) S 41,733.00 Chevy Suburban S 41,733.00

liderton No bid

Tindol Ford $ 35,325.28 Ford Expedition $ 3532528 $ 35,325.28
Piedmont Truck Center No bid

Abernethy Chrysler Jeep No bid

Spec #5

Mid-Size Hybrid Sedan - Social Services 1

Ben Mynatt $ 26,382.00 Chevy Malibu S 26,382.00

liderton No bid

Tindol Ford S 23,328.74 Ford Fusion Hybrid $ 23,328.74 $ 23,328.74
Piedmont Truck Center No bid

Abernethy Chrysler Jeep No bid

Spec #6

Full Size 1/2 Ton Pick-up Truck 4x4 - Building Inspections 1

Ben Mynatt $ 25,116.00 Chevy 1500 Silverado S 25,116.00

liderton S 23,693.00 Ram 1500 S 23,693.00

Tindol Ford $ 23,370.28 Ford F-150 S 23,370.28

Piedmont Truck Center No bid

Abernethy Chrysler Jeep $ 23,310.85 Ram 1500 $ 23,310.85 $ 23,310.85
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Unit Price Recommended
Spec #7 Bid Amount Make/Model Qty Extended Award
Cab & Chassis with Dump Bed Extended Cab 4x4 - Parks & Rec 1
Ben Mynatt No bid
liderton $ 42,387.00 Ram 3500 $ 42,387.00 $ 42,387.00
Tindol Ford $ 44,570.56 Ford F-450 S 44,570.56
Piedmont Truck Center S 44,050.00 Ford F-450 S 44,050.00
Abernethy Chrysler Jeep S 46,082.00 Ram 4500 S 46,082.00
Spec #8
Full Size Extended Cab Truck 4x4 - Power Plant 1
Ben Mynatt $ 29,978.00 Chevy 2500 Silverado S 29,978.00
liderton S 34,010.00 Ram 2500 S 34,010.00
Tindol Ford $ 27,569.43 Ford F-150 $ 27,569.43 $ 27,569.43
Piedmont Truck Center S 28,625.00 Ford F-250 S 28,625.00
Abernethy Chrysler Jeep $ 29,298.85 S 29,298.85
Spec #9
Service Body with Crane 4x4 Truck - Power Plant 1
Ben Mynatt No bid
liderton $ 90,395.00 S 90,395.00
Tindol Ford $ 83,574.50 Ford F-450 $ 8357450 $ 83,574.50
Piedmont Truck Center S 85,750.00 Ford F-450 S 85,750.00
Abernethy Chrysler Jeep No bid
Spec #10
3/4 Ton Extended Cab Service Body 4x4 Truck - Solid Waste 1
Ben Mynatt (with exception) $ 34,806.00 Chevy 2500 Silverado S 34,806.00
liderton S 33,199.00 Ram 2500 S 33,199.00
Tindol Ford $ 32,595.56 Ford F-250 $ 3259556 $ 32,595.56
Piedmont Truck Center S 33,057.00 Ford F-250 S 33,057.00
Abernethy Chrysler Jeep S 35,203.00 S 35,203.00
Spec #11
Extended Cab & Chassis Dump Bed 4x4 Truck - Solid Waste 1
Ben Mynatt No bid
liderton S 48,862.00 Ram 4500 S 48,862.00
Tindol Ford $ 50,269.56 Ford F-450 $  50,269.56
Piedmont Truck Center S 47,125.00 Ford F-450 S 47,125.00
Abernethy Chrysler Jeep $ 46,082.00 Ram 4500 S 46,082.00 $ 46,082.00
Spec #12
Van/Wagon 5-Passenger Extended Wheelbase - Info Technology 1
Ben Mynatt No bid
llderton (with exception; doesn’t meet 2.5L engine spec) S 22,402.00 Ram Promaster City S 22,402.00
Tindol Ford $ 23,428.14 Ford Transit Connect Wagon $  23,428.14 $ 23,428.14
Piedmont Truck Center No bid
Abernethy Chrysler Jeep No bid

TOTAL - Vehicle Unit Costs Recommended for Award

27

$ 786,634.50
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Unit Price Recommended
AMBULANCES Bid Amount Make/Model Qty Extended Award
Ambulance - Type 1, Class 1, 4x2, Configuration A - GEMS 3
Northwestern - extending FY 14-15 contract as allowed by contract
using FY 16-17 bid price $275,763.00 Type 1 $ 827,289.00 $ 827,289.00
QRV 4x4 AEV - GEMS 1
Northwestern per HGAC Contract #AM10-16 $174,678.00 QRV $ 174,678.00 $ 174,678.00
BACKHOE LOADER - Landfill 1
James River Companies - per State Contract 760H $ 90,783.00 John Deere 310 SL $ 90,783.00 $ 90,783.00
TOTAL of Extended Unit Prices for Award $1,879,384.50

See separate chart showing recommended vehicle costs plus equipment,
decals and tag/tax/title for total cost related to vehicles.



