
Temporry Staffing Assignments

RFP # 2025-004

Spec #1: ACCESS Dispatcher BUDGET CUT

Spec #2: Administrative Assistant

Spec #3: Economic Services Caseworker II

Spec #4: Social Worker II (Foster Care)

Spec #5: Social Worker III (Foster Care)

Spec #6: Social Worker II Nutrition (Adult & Aging Services)

 Spec #7: Social Worker III (Adult & Aging Services)

 Spec #8: Crisis Line Advocate

 Spec #9: Bilingual Shelter Advocate

 Spec #10: Relief Shelter Operator

Spec #11: Social Worker (IAT)

Spec #12: Social Worker (IAT Night Duty)

Scores

Proposers Spec #1 Spec #2 Spec #3 Spec #4 Spec #5 Spec #6 Spec #7 Spec #8 Spec #9 Spec #10 Spec #11 Spec #12

Vanguard Professional Staffing AWARDED NO BID NO BID 87/100 NO BID 87/100 NO BID 87/100 NO BID NO BID NO BID 87/100 87/100

Nesco Resource AWARDED BUDGET CUT 86.07/100 86.07/100 86.07/100 86.07/100 86.07/100 86.07/100 86.07/100 86.07/100 86.07/100 86.07/100 86.07/100

Health Advocates Network BUDGET CUT 84.41/100 84.41/100 84.41/100 84.41/100 84.41/100 84.41/100 84.41/100 84.41/100 84.41/100 84.41/100 84.41/100

Lancesoft BUDGET CUT 80/100 80/100 80/100 80/100 80/100 80/100 80/100 80/100 80/100 80/100 80/100

Staffmark BUDGET CUT 60.35/100 60.35/100 60.35/100 60.35/100 60.35/100 60.35/100 60.35/100 60.35/100 60.35/100 60.35/100 60.35/100

Abacus BUDGET CUT 74.28/100 74.28/100 74.28/100 74.28/100 74.28/100 74.28/100 74.28/100 74.28/100 74.28/100 74.28/100 74.28/100

Proposer #1 Proposer #2 Proposer #3 Proposer #4 Proposer #5 Proposer #6
Vanguard Nesco Health Advocates Lancesoft Staffmark Abacus

96/100 86/100 87/100 83/100 46/100 58_/100
78/100 89/100 88/100 79/100 60/100 68.5/100
_____/100 90.5/100 88/100 85/100 56.5/100 79/100
_____/100 101/100 93/100 78/100 57/100 74.5/100
_____/100 94/100 91/100 86/100 77/100 83/100
_____/100 80/100 59.5/100 84/100 62/100 88_/100
_____/100 62/100 _____/100 65/100 64/100 69/100
_____/100 _____/100 _____/100 ______/100 ______/100 ______/100
_____/100 _____/100 _____/100 ______/100 ______/100 ______/100
_____/100 _____/100 _____/100 ______/100 ______/100 ______/100

Average Score 87/100 86.07/100 84.41/100 80/100 60.35/100 74.28/100

* Even though Vanguard has a slightly higher score for Spec #3, the agency has chose to award this service to Nesco due to them providing similar positions in prior years,  

 lower price differential, prior experience with the agency, and ease of transitioning current staff to their agency. 
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